
$649,900 - 67 BRIDGEWATER Court
 

Listing ID: 40339440

$649,900
3 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 1190
Single Family

67 BRIDGEWATER Court, Welland,
Ontario, L3C7M6

Welcome home! Accessible 2+1 bedroom
bungalow on a large pie shaped lot. The
main floor of the home features 2 large
bedrooms, easy to maintain luxury vinyl
flooring, a well equipped kitchen, large
living/dining room with gas fireplace, a
gorgeous sunroom and a main 3 piece
bathroom has been outfitted with a
wheelchair accessible shower. The finished
basement offers a huge rec room, 3rd
bedroom, another 3 piece bathroom and
plenty of storage space. The backyard
features both a nice sized fenced area and
large open lawn (see photos for drawing of
lot boundaries). Parking for 3 available
between the attached single car garage and
driveway. Only a few minutes walk to the
Seaway Mall, Zehrs Supermarket, Niagara
College, and Restaurants. Easy access to the
406 highway, via nearby Woodlawn Rd. if
you are looking for easy living without
giving up too much space this is the home
for you! The property is wheel chair
accessible. (id:23349)
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