
$849,000 - 165 EAST WEST LINE Line
 

Listing ID: 40340345

$849,000
3 Bedrooms, 2 Bathrooms, 0.94 acres
Single Family

165 EAST WEST LINE Line, Niagara-on-
the-Lake, Ontario, L0S1J0

Almost a full acre (.94) in a well sought
after country location. Fix up, or tear down,
this property boasts many opportunities to
do as you wish (within the limits of the
zoning of course). The home of your dreams
would fit very nicely here, nestled amongst
our renowned orchards and vineyards.
Conveniently located an equal distance and
just a short drive to picturesque old town
Niagara on the Lake, and the Garden
City...St. Catharines. Included with the sale
is a Ford 4600 tractor with a mower
attachment and snow plow blade. Single car
garage, with attached shop and chicken
coop. All buildings on the property in
various states of disrepair. Being sold as is,
where is, with no representations or
warranties by the seller on the home,
outbuildings or any included equipment.
(id:23349)
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